TO: Recreation Department Concessions Bidders (see distribution)
FROM: Justin Pitcher, Recreation Department

SUBIJECT: Notice of Intent to Award Bid No. 962-0311-14F

DATE: March 19, 2014

On March 11, 2014, the City of Antioch, Recreation Department received submittals for BiD NO.
962-0311-14F, for Recreation Department Concessions Food and Supplies.

This is notification of intent to award the bid to the apparent overall low bidder, US Foods,
Livermore, California.

The City of Antioch would like to thank you for your participation in our bid process.

Attachment: Bid Tabulation

Distribution:

US Foods Inc., Livermore, California 925-628-5430 ron2.williams@usfoods.com

Sysco San Francisco Inc., Fremont, California 510-226-3135 pham.jaclynn@sfo.sysco.com

Recreation Department
P.O. Box 5007-Tel. 925-776-3070+Fax. 925-776-3078-www.ci.antioch.ca.us



Tabulation of Bids
BID NO. 962-0311-14F
Recreation Department Concessions Food & Supplies

Product Description US FOODS INC SYSCO FOODS INC
Potato, French-fry 3/8” Extra-long frozen garlic flavor raw $38.74 NO BID
Potato, French-fry 5/6" straight-cut line flow grade A frozen $25.47 NO BID
Chicken, Nugget Breaded .69 oz. raw $24.29 NO BID
Bun, sliced plain hot dog 6” frozen $27.10 NO BID
Corn Dog, turkey child-nutrition frozen with stick $28.52 NO BID
Pepper, jalapeno nacho sliced $29.52 NO BID
Chip, tortilla corn white triangle $21.44 NO BID
Shortening, frying vegetable liquid clear trans-fat-free $25.43 NO BID
foodservice

Sauce, Ortega Chili shelf stable in pouch $42.36 NO BID
Sauce, Ortega nacho cheese shelf stable pouch $46.10 NO BID
Ketchup, tomato foil packets shelf stable $32.39 NO BID
Relish, foil packets shelf stable $12.55 NO BID
Mustard, yellow mild foil packet shelf stable $20.29 NO BID
Ketchup, tomato dispensing pouch shelf stable $23.51 NO BID
Mustard, yellow mild dispensing pouch shelf stable $24.35 NO BID
Chips, Potato bbq lays 1.5 oz. $27.23 NO BID
Chips, Potato regular lays 1.5 oz. $27.38 NO BID
Chips, Tortilla Cool Ranch 1.75 oz. $27.38 NO BID
Chips, Tortilla Nacho Cheese 1.75 oz. $27.38 NO BID
Chips, Cheetos Regular 2.1 oz. $30.33 NO BID
Chips, Cheetos Flaming Hot 2.0 oz. $30.89 NO BID
Ice Cream Bar, fudge $14.90 NO BID
Ice Cream Bar, heath bar §22.27 NO BID
Ice Cream Bar, Strawberry Shortcake 518.88 NO BID
Ice Cream Sandwich, Chocolate Cookie (Toll House) $20.29 NO BID
Ice Cream Cup, Lemonade $24.57 NO BID
Ice Cream Cup, Chocolate Malt $12.48 NO BID
Tray, carry out 5.5X9X2.25 paper natural $18.31 NO BID
Carton, paper French-fry 4X3.5X1.25 $48.68 NO BID
Hairnets, 28” black lightweight $15.78 NO BID
Cleaner, fryer boil out Mr. Muscle $44.35 NO BID
Grill brick, wrapped 4X3.5X8 $20.30 NO BID
Forks, heavy-duty plastic polypropylene $26.61 NO BID
Spoons, tea heavy duty plastic polypropylene $26.61 NO BID
Hot Dog, all-meat roller drill 8:1 6” frozen $23.98 NO BID
Tray, nacho plastic large 8X6.25X1.5 clear 2 compartment $59.17 NO BID
Straw, jumbo 7.75” translucent wrapped plastic $37.66 NO BID
Cup, 2 oz. Soufflé portion translucent plastic $53.08 NO BID
Lid, 2 oz. Soufflé portion translucent plastic $66.27 NO BID
Candy, Snickers $34.12 NO BID
Candy, Twix §27.24 NO BID




Product Description Qty. Per Unit Unit of Measure
Candy, Starburst $26.64 NO BID
Candy, Skittles $26.64 NO BID
Candy, M&M $35.49 NO BID
Candy, M&M Peanut $35.49 NO BID
Candy, Milky Way $268.44 NO BID
Candy, Ring Pop Special Order NO BID
Candy, Red Rope Special Order NO BID
Churro, 10", Cinnamon Sugar $51.89 NO BID
Pretzel, original, with salt $47.48 NO BID




