W1.
w2,
W3.
w4,
WS5.
W6.
W7.
WS8.

W10.
W11.
wi12.
W13.
W14.
W15.
W16.
W17.

R1.
R2.
R3.
R4.
R5.
R6.
R7.
R8.
R9.
R10.
R11.
R12.
R13.
R14.

Description

W1 ... W75 ca

As above

W3-1, Wi2-1, W3-2
As above

W13-A

W7-3A

S1-1 (fl. yellow/green)
As above

S4-3 (fl. yellow/green)
W10-1

W10-1

W55 ca plastic

W1-8

SW44 ca (fl. yellow/green)

W11-2 (fl. yellow/green)
W11-2 (fl. yellow/green)

W16-7P (fl. yellow/green)

R1-1

As above

As above

As above

R1-3, R1-4

As above

R1-2

R2-1 ... R42 ca
As above

As above

R6-1

R5-1

R5-1A

R3-1 ... R48 ca

Size

36"x36"
30"x30"
36"x36"
48"x48"
24"x24"
24"x18"

30"
36"

24"x8"

36"
30"

24"x24"
24"x30"
18"x18"
36"x36"
30"x30"
24"x12"
30"x30"
18"x18"
36"x36"
48"x48"
12"x6"
18"x6"

36"

24"x30"
30"x36"
36"x48"
36"x12"
36"x36"
36"x21"
24"x24"

Safeway Sign Co.

Quantity Adelanto, CA
Unit Ext.
40 $39.78 $1,591.20
40 $27.63 $1,105.20
5 $42.28 $211.40
10 $70.72 $707.20
5 $17.68 $88.40
5 $13.31 $66.55
20 $46.88 $937.60
20 $67.50 $1,350.00
5 $10.72 $53.60
10 $39.78 $397.80
10 $26.38 $263.80
20 $11.88 $237.60
20 $22.10 $442.00
20 $17.23 $344.60
10 $67.50 $675.00
10 $46.88 $468.80
20 $15.45 $309.00
100 $30.75 $3,075.00
5 $10.30 $51.50
5 $39.78 $198.90
5 $70.72 $353.60
5 $3.26 $16.30
5 $4.27 $21.35
5 $17.24 $86.20
25 $24.60 $615.00
10 $33.15 $331.50
20 $59.04 $1,180.80
1 $13.31 $13.31
1 $39.78 $39.78
1 $23.21 $23.21
5 $17.68 $88.40

City of Antioch Bid Tabulation
Bid No. 801-0610-10F - Street, Regulatory, and Warning Signs
Bid Closed June 29, 2010 @ 2:00 p.m.

Maneri Sign
Gardena, CA
Unit Ext

$32.30 $1,292.00
$22.25  $890.00
$34.50 $172.50
$57.50 $575.00
$15.50 $77.50
$12.00 $60.00
$50.00 $1,000.00
$74.00 $1,480.00
$16.00 $80.00
$32.00 $320.00
$21.00 $210.00
$10.00  $200.00
$18.50 $370.00
$18.00 $360.00
$74.00 $740.00
$50.00 $500.00
$16.00 $320.00
$22.00 $2,200.00
$10.50 $52.50
$34.00 $170.00
$57.50 $287.50

$4.50 $22.50

$5.00 $25.00
$20.00 $100.00
$20.00 $500.00
$29.50 $295.00
$42.00 $840.00
$25.00 $25.00
$36.00 $36.00
$30.00 $30.00
$15.00 $75.00

Custom
Products Corp.
Jackson, MS
Unit Ext.
$37.71  $1,508.40
$26.73  $1,069.20
$44.42 $222.10
$78.53 $785.30

$16.65 $83.25
$12.50 $62.50
$47.77 $955.40
$68.48  $1,369.60
$10.67 $53.35
$36.07 $360.70
$25.23 $252.30
$13.91 $278.20
$20.75 $415.00
$18.14 $362.80
$68.48 $684.80
$47.77 $477.70
$16.10 $322.00
$22.79  $2,279.00
$9.87 $49.35
$32.35 $161.75
$57.51 $287.55
$2.91 $14.55
$4.36 $21.80
$16.52 $82.60
$21.93 $548.25
$32.01 $320.10
$53.86  $1,077.20
$12.50 $12.50
$36.07 $36.07
$24.16 $24.16
$17.57 $87.85

Custom

SESA, Inc.
dba Signco
Anaheim, CA
Unit Ext.
$40.68 $1,627.20
$28.25 $1,130.00
$44.10 $220.50
$78.40 $784.00
$18.08 $90.40
$13.56 $67.80
$51.62 $1,032.40
$74.34 $1,486.80
$11.01 $55.05
$40.68 $406.80
$28.25 $282.50
$18.08 $361.60
$22.80 $452.00
$18.58 $371.70
$74.34 $743.40
$51.67 $516.20
$16.52 $330.40
$27.97 $2,797.00
$10.17 $50.85
$40.68 $203.40
$72.32 $361.60
$2.26 $11.30
$3.39 $16.95
$20.34 $101.70
$22.60 $565.00
$33.90 $339.00
$54.24  $1,084.80
$13.56 $13.56
$40.68 $40.68
$23.73 $23.73
$19.60 $98.00
SESA, Inc.

Western
Highway Products
Stanton, CA
Unit Ext.

$49.60 $1,984.00
$35.00 $1,400.00
$51.60 $258.00
$82.10 $821.00
$23.00 $115.00
$19.00 $95.00
$52.60 $1,052.00
$84.30 $1,686.00
$16.00  $80.00
$57.00 $570.00
$40.00 $400.00
$18.00 $360.00
$32.00 $640.00
$24.00 $480.00
$84.30 $843.00
$52.60 $526.00
$22.00 $440.00
$36.00 $3,600.00
$16.70  $83.50
$50.00 $250.00
$86.00 $430.00

$8.00 $40.00

$9.30 $46.50
$50.00 $250.00
$32.00 $800.00
$34.00 $340.00
$71.00 $1,420.00
$19.00 $19.00
$51.60 $51.60
$33.00 $33.00
$25.00 $125.00

Western

P.S. Services, Inc.

American
Sign Brackets

Zumar Ir

Anaheim, CA Green Forest, AR Santa Fe £
$207.00 $8,280.00 - No Bid - $41.04
$143.75 $5,750.00 - No Bid - $28.50
$207.00 $1,035.00 - No Bid - $47.20
$368.00  $920.00 - No Bid - $83.17
$92.00 $460.00 - No Bid - $18.08
$69.00 $345.00 - No Bid - $16.28
$143.75 $2,875.00 - No Bid - $51.05
$207.00 $4,140.00 - No Bid - $68.73
$46.00 $230.00 - No Bid - $11.81
$207.00 $2,070.00 - No Bid - $41.04
$207.00 $2,070.00 - No Bid - $28.50
$92.00 $1,840.00 - No Bid - $14.20
$115.00 $2,300.00 - No Bid - $22.60
$51.75 $1,035.00 - No Bid - $19.98
$207.00 $2,070.00 - No Bid - $68.73
$143.75 $1,437.50 - No Bid - $51.05
$46.00 $920.00 - No Bid - $17.76
$143.75 $14,375.00 - No Bid - $28.50
$51.75 $258.75 - No Bid - $12.22
$207.00 $1,035.00 - No Bid - $41.04
$368.00 $1,840.00 - No Bid - $72.32
$34.50 $172.50 - No Bid - $3.95
$46.00 $230.00 - No Bid - $4.40
$207.00 $1,035.00 - No Bid - $25.50
$115.00 $2,875.00 - No Bid - $22.60
$172.50 $1,725.00 - No Bid - $33.90
$276.00 $5,520.00 - No Bid - $54.24
$69.00 $69.00 - No Bid - $16.28
$207.00 $207.00 - No Bid - $41.04
$103.50 $103.50 - No Bid - $22.60
$92.00 $460.00 - No Bid - $18.08

American



R15.
R16.
R17.
R18.
R19.
R20.

S1.
S2.
S3.
S4.

S5.

S6.
S7.
S8.
S9.

S10.
S11.
S12.
S13.
S14.

S15.
S16.
H1.
H2.
H3.

H4.

Description

As above

As above

R49 ca

R26 series, R28 series, R30
R99 ca

OM1-3

City standard street name sign
As above

As above

Rivertown standard str. name
sign w/camelback, .125 alum.
Rivertown standard str. name
sign w/o camlbk, .125 alum.
G8's, hid item per sf of sign
G8's, bid item per sf of sign
R73 series, bid item per sq ft
Pressure sensitive sheeting w/

Size

30"x30"
36"x36"
36"x18"
12"x18"
12"x18"
18"x18"
24"
30"
36"

Var. x 18"
Var. x 36"

Variable

9"x3-1/2"

pop. to update City limit sign, 2" letters

Service and park signs
National Park Service arrows
Spec. pkg signs, double sided
As above

Spec. signs, single sided,

bid item per sq. ft. of sign
Neighborhood Watch signs
City I.D. sticker, blue on white
Sign to sign hardware for
street name signs (808F)
Sign to pole hardware for

2" diameter round pipe (808F)
Sign to pole hardware for 2"
0.D. sq. tubing (850F long)

L bracket to 2" dia. round pipe

30"x30"
12"x12"
12"x18"
12"x30"
Variable

18"x24"
4"x4"

Safeway Sign Co.

Quantity Adelanto, CA
5 $27.63 $138.15
5 $39.78 $198.90
5 $19.89 $99.45
5 $7.28 $36.40
5 $7.28 $36.40

20 $10.30 $206.00
5 $26.01 $130.05
20 $29.76  $595.20
100 $33.52 $3,352.00
10 $50.69 $506.90
10 $44.27 $442.70
15 $11.44 $171.60
10 $11.44 $114.40
10 $11.44 $114.40
20 $2.67 $53.40
5 $31.38 $156.90
5 $5.27 $26.35
20 $9.66 $193.20
20 $15.10 $302.00
200sf  $8.02 $1,604.00
50 $13.31 $665.50
500 $1.41 $705.00
50 $5.77 $288.50
50 $5.66 $283.00
50 $5.77 $288.50
25 $26.80 $670.00

Maneri Sign
Gardena, CA
$2450 $122.50
$34.00 $170.00
$17.50 $87.50
$6.50 $32.50
$6.50 $32.50
$8.90 $178.00
$22.00 $110.00
$28.50 $570.00
$30.00 $3,000.00
$65.00 $650.00
$45.00 $450.00
$7.00 $105.00
$7.00 $70.00
$7.00 $70.00
$2.25 $45.00
$26.00 $130.00
$6.00 $30.00
$7.50 $150.00
$11.50 $230.00
$4.50 $900.00
$14.00 $700.00
$0.80 $400.00
$4.95 $247.50
$5.05 $252.50
$5.05 $252.50
$26.75  $668.75

Products Corp.

Jackson, MS
$26.73 $133.65
$37.71 $188.55
$18.72 $93.60
$7.06 $35.30
$6.60 $33.00
$9.70 $194.00
$20.68 $103.40
$25.84 $516.80
$29.89 $2,989.00
$82.70 $827.00
$32.30 $323.00
$11.40 $171.00
$11.50 $115.00
$6.21 $62.10
$1.42 $28.40
$25.23 $126.15
$8.76 $43.80
$9.90 $198.00
$16.68 $333.60
$5.04  $1,008.00
$13.35 $667.50
$0.79 $395.00
$6.04 $302.00
$6.30 $315.00
$6.16 $308.00
$4.88 $122.00

dba Signco
Anaheim, CA

$30.62 $153.10
$44.10 $220.50
$20.34 $101.70
$6.78 $33.90
$6.78 $33.90
$10.17 $203.40
$19.98 $99.90
$24.98 $499.50
$29.97 $2,997.00
$42.59 $425.90
$24.98 $249.80
$4.52 $45.20
$4.52 $45.20
$4.52 $45.20
$7.29 $145.80
$30.63 $153.15
$4.90 $24.40
$6.78 $135.00
$11.30 $226.00
$4.52 $904.00
$15.87 $793.50
$0.89 $445.00

- No Bid -

- No Bid -

- No Bid -

- No Bid -

Highway Products

Stanton, CA
$37.00 $185.00
$53.60 $268.00
$29.50 $147.50
$12.00 $60.00
$12.00 $60.00
$16.00 $320.00
$48.00 $240.00
$35.40 $708.00
$35.00 $3,500.00
$61.90 $619.00
$47.00 $470.00
$8.00 $120.00
$8.00 $80.00
$6.00 $60.00
$13.00 $260.00
$37.50 $187.50
$20.00 $100.00
$19.60 $392.00
$26.00 $520.00
$6.00 $1,200.00
$28.00 $1,400.00
$0.98  $490.00
$7.30  $365.00
$7.60  $380.00
$7.70  $385.00

- No Bid -

P.S. Services, Inc.

Sign Brackets

Zumar Ir

Anaheim, CA Green Forest, AR Santa Fe £
$143.75 $718.75 - No Bid - $28.50
$207.00 $1,035.00 - No Bid - $41.04
$101.50 $507.50 - No Bid - $20.34
$40.00 $200.00 - No Bid - $8.14
$40.00 $200.00 - No Bid - $8.14
$69.00 $1,380.00 - No Bid - $12.22
$63.50 $317.50 - No Bid - $31.56
$67.50 $1,350.00 - No Bid - $39.45
$73.50 $7,350.00 - No Bid - $47.34
$137.50 $1,375.00 - No Bid - $55.00
$134.50 $1,345.00 - No Bid - $47.34
$23.00 $345.00 - No Bid - $10.37
$23.00 $230.00 - No Bid - $10.37
$23.00 $230.00 - No Bid - $10.37
$58.75 $1,175.00 - No Bid - $9.55
$115.00 $575.00 - No Bid - $31.35
$34.50 $175.50 - No Bid - $5.99
$23.00 $1,150.00 - No Bid - $12.44
$57.50 $1,150.00 - No Bid - $20.73
$23.00 $4,600.00 - No Bid - $5.99
$67.77  $3,388.00 - No Bid - $22.20

$8.50  $4,240.00 - No Bid - $4.40
$22.50 $1,125.00 $5.09 $254.50 $5.95
$3.50 $175.00 $5.30 $265.00 $5.95
$3.50 $175.00 $5.41 $270.50 $5.95
$2.50 $62.50 $6.25 $156.25  $35.00



H5.
H6.

H7.

H8.
Ho.

H10.
H11.
H12.
H13.
H14.

Above prices do not include sales tax.

Description

L bracket to 2: O.D. sq. tubing
Sign posts, sq. galv., 12 ga.,
No. 20F12-10'

Sign posts, sq. galv., 12 ga.,
No. 20F12-12"

12 ga. anchors, galvanized
12 ga. anchors, galvanized
12 ga. anchors, galvanized
Corner Bolts (TL0O70)

Heavy duty jam nuts (TL062)
Drive rivets steel (TL3808)
Sign to pole hardware (1010)

6/29/2010

Safeway Sign Co.

Size Quantity Adelanto, CA
50 $29.31 $1,465.50
2"x10" 50 $29.02 $1,451.00
2"x12"' 50 $34.49 $1,724.50
2.5"x18" 150 $6.99 $1,048.50
2.25"x24" 100 $8.02  $802.00
2.25"x30" 100 $9.44  $944.00
5/16" 500 $0.53  $265.00
5/16" 500 $0.18 $90.00
3/8" 1,000 $0.84  $840.00
25 $6.88  $172.00
Terms/Discount: Net 30

Maneri Sign
Gardena, CA

$29.25 $1,462.00
$24.00 $1,200.00

$28.70 $1,435.00

$5.75 $862.50
$6.65 $665.00
$7.80 $780.00
$0.50 $250.00
$0.25 $125.00
$0.85 $850.00
$6.45 $161.25
Net 30

Custom
Products Corp.
Jackson, MS
$4.88 $122.00
$26.79 $1,339.50
$32.15 $1,607.50
$5.63 $844.50
$6.84 $684.00
$8.55 $855.00
$0.73 $365.00
- No Bid -
$0.42  $4,200.00
$1.00 $25.00
Net 30

SESA, Inc. Western
dba Signco Highway Products
Anaheim, CA Stanton, CA
- No Bid - - No Bid -
$22.50 $1,125.00 $35.30 $1,765.00
$37.06 $1,353.00 $42.40 $2,120.00
- No Bid - $7.00 $1,050.00
- No Bid - $9.80  $980.00
- No Bid - $10.70 $1,070.00
- No Bid - $0.60  $300.00
- No Bid - $0.05 $25.00
- No Bid - $0.60  $600.00
- No Bid - $8.70  $217.50

2% 15 days

2% 10, Net 30

P.S. Services, Inc.

American
Sign Brackets

Zumar Ir

Anaheim, CA Green Forest, AR Santa Fe £
$2.50 $125.00 $6.25 $312.50 $35.00
$48.50 $2,425.00 - No Bid - $25.73
$52.50 $262.50 - No Bid - $30.84
$18.50 $2,775.00 - No Bid - $5.95
$26.52 $2,652.00 - No Bid - $7.10
$31.50 $3,150.00 - No Bid - $8.88
$0.85 $425.00 - No Bid - $0.65
$1.10 $550.00 - No Bid - $0.59
$0.35 $350.00 - No Bid - $0.65
$18.56 $464.00 $6.25 $156.25 $7.50

Net 30 Net 30 Nei



1dustries
springs, CA

Ext.

$1,641.60
$1,140.00
$236.00
$831.70
$90.40
$81.40
$1,021.00
$1,374.60
$59.05
$410.40
$285.00
$284.00
$452.00
$399.60
$687.30
$510.50
$355.20
$2,850.00
$61.10
$205.20
$361.60
$19.75
$22.00
$127.50
$565.00
$339.00
$1,084.80
$16.28
$41.04
$22.60
$90.40



1dustries
springs, CA

$142.50
$205.20
$101.70
$40.70
$40.70
$244.40
$157.80
$789.00
$4,734.00
$550.00

$473.40

$155.55
$103.70
$103.70
$191.00

$156.75
$29.95
$248.40
$414.60
$1,198.00

$1,110.00

$2,200.00
$297.50
$297.50
$297.50

$875.00



1dustries
springs, CA

$1,750.00
$1,286.50

$1,542.00

$892.50
$710.00
$888.00
$325.00
$295.00
$650.00
$187.50

t 30



