
City of Antioch Bid Tabulation
Bid No. 645-1114-09F

Copy and Printer Paper
Closed December 3, 2008, 2:00 p.m.

Corporate
Kelly Paper Xpedx Office Depot Express Office Depot

Description Qty. Unit Concord, CA Hayward, CA Fremont, CA Newark, CA Fremont, CA

1.  20 lb white bond, sub-20, 8-1/2x11" 20 plt $1,200.00 $1,135.60 $1,237.00 $1,220.00 $1,326.00

2.  Recycled white, 8-1/2x11" 20 plt $1,320.00 $1,382.48 $1,384.80 $1,422.00 $1,542.40

3.  Same as above, colors canary, tan, 20 cs $34.80 $37.40 No Bid No Bid $46.72
pink, cherry, goldenrod, blue, green, virgin (recycled)

4.  Same as above in colors, recycled 20 cs $34.80 $37.40 $38.11 $43.11 No Bid

5.  Paper, 8-1/2x14", white and colors 20 cs $40.85 (wht) $42.39 (wht) $44.29 $44.00 $63.17
$49.55 (clrs) $50.49 (clrs) (virg. white)

$47.09
(recyc. white)

6.  Same as above, recycled 20 cs $45.98 (wht) $46.84 (wht) $51.90 $47.60 No Bid
$49.55 (clrs) $50.49 (clrs) (colors only) $48.80

(no goldenrod)

7.  Paper, 110 lb cardstock, 8-1/2"x11", 20 cs $41.04 (wht) $37.51 (wht) $34.80 $62.20 $49.41
colors white, lt. blue, canary, cherry, $43.44 (clrs) $40.00 (clrs) (white only)
buff, green, salmon (recycled)

8.  Same as above, recycled 20 cs $41.04 (wht) $37.51 (wht) $34.36 No Bid No Bid
$43.44 (clrs) $40.00 (clrs) (cherry and

buff only)

9.  Paper, 20 lb. bond, 11"x17", colors: 10 cs $32.50 (wht) $33.33 $37.03 $68.90 $49.66
white, blue, canary, pink, goldenrod, grn $39.75 (clrs) (virg. white) (white only) (white only)

$39.71
(colors recyc.)

10.  Same as above, recycled 10 cs $39.75 $36.83 (wht) No Bid $74.00 No Bid
$39.71 (clrs) (white only)

11.  NCR, 20 lb., 8-1/2"x11", 3-part, 2 cs $101.40 $104.34 $182.29 $13.84 $125.44
reverse, black print, white/yellow/pink

12.  Paper, NCR, 20 lb., 8-1/2"x11", 2 cs $89.80 $92.79 $162.53 $13.23 $111.54
2-part, reverse, black print

Terms:    Net 30 2%, 30 Days Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

12/3/08
Above prices do not include sales tax.
Excel:f/paperbidtab09
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