
Grand Total Terms
Unit Cost Ext. Unit Cost Ext. Unit Cost Ext. Unit Cost Ext. Unit Cost Ext.

Quantity:  
Apex Universal, Inc.
Santa Fe Springs, CA $0.76 $3,800 $0.76 $760 $0.76 $2,280 $0.39 $1,950 $0.37 $1,850 $10,640 Net 30
Interstate Sales
Auburn, CA $0.75 $3,750 $0.85 $850 $0.77 $2,310 $0.40 $2,000 $0.37 $1,850 $10,760 Net 30
U.S. Signs and Safety
Durham, NC $0.79 $3,950 $0.90 $900 $0.79 $2,370 $0.51 $2,550 $0.49 $2,450 $12,220 Net 30
Comade, Inc.
Irvine, CA $0.87 $4,350 $0.87 $870 $0.87 $2,610 $0.47 $2,350 $0.45 $2,250 $12,430 Net 30
Pacific Products & Serv.
Highland, CA $0.87 $4,350 $0.96 $960 $0.89 $2,670 $0.45 $2,250 $0.45 $2,250 $12,480 Net 30
Bay Area Barricade Serv.
Concord, CA $0.85 $4,250 $1.07 $1,070 $0.93 $2,790 $0.55 $2,750 $0.53 $2,650 $13,510 Net 30
Zumar
Santa Fe Springs, CA $1.01 $5,050 $1.18 $1,180 $0.93 $2,790 $0.52 $2,600 $0.54 $2,700 $14,320 Net 30
Maneri Sign Co., Inc.
Gardena, CA $0.94 $4,700 $0.96 $960 $0.99 $2,970 $0.65 $3,250 $0.64 $3,200 $15,080 Net 30
Western Highway Products
Stanton, CA $1.03 $5,150 $1.38 $1,380 $1.07 $3,210 $0.52 $2,600 $0.55 $2,750 $15,090 Net 30
BC Traffic Specialist
Anaheim, CA $1.17 $5,850 $1.35 $1,350 $1.17 $3,510 $0.62 $3,100 $0.62 $3,100 $16,910 Net 30
Custom Products Corp.
Jackson, MS $1.31 $6,550 $1.31 $1,310 $1.31 $3,930 $0.64 $3,200 $0.61 $3,050 $18,040 Net 30
Hall Signs, Inc.
Bloomington, IN $1.13 $5,650 $1.43 $1,430 $1.16 $3,480 $0.84 $4,200 $0.78 $3,900 $18,660 Net 30
Hawkins Traffic Safety Sup.
Berkeley, CA $2.43 $12,150 $2.80 $2,800 $2.43 $7,290 $0.90 $4,500 $0.86 $4,300 $31,040 Net 30
3M Company
St. Paul, MN $1.10 $5,500 $1.54 $1,540 $1.10 $3,300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,340 Net 30
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