
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
330,000 330,000 30,000 30,000 Earliest Terms/

Vendor Name  Recycled Extension Virgin Extension Recycled Extension Virgin Extension Delivery F.O.B. Discount

All Pro Printing Solutions $20.55/M $6,781.50 $19.70 $6,501.00 $20.55 $616.50 $19.70 $591.00 7-10 days Antioch Net 30
San Ramon, CA

Touch Plate, Inc. $21.8756 $7,218.95 $19.044 $6,284.52 $21.8756 $656.27 $19.044 $571.32 10 days Dublin, CA 2% 10,  Net 30
Dublin, CA

Vision Envelope $23.30 $7,689.00 $21.85 $7,210.50 $23.30 $699.00 $21.85 $655.50 3 weeks Antioch 1% 10,  Net 30
Los Angeles, CA

Lefavor Envelope $23.98 $7,913.40 $22.63 $7,467.90 $23.98 $719.40 $22.63 $678.90 4-5 days Antioch Net 30
Salt Lake City, Utah

Folger Graphics $25.13 $8,292.90 $22.85 $7,540.50 $25.13 $753.90 $22.85 $685.50 5-8 working days Antioch Net 30
Hayward, CA

International Security Products $25.16 $8,302.80 $23.00 $7,590.00 $25.16 $754.80 $23.00 $690.00 7-10 days Antioch Net 30
Paso Robles, CA

Integrity Business Solutions $25.45 $8,398.50 $24.30 $8,019.00 $25.45 $763.50 $24.30 $729.00 4 weeks Antioch Net 20
Martinez, CA

Central Valley Business Forms $25.65 $8,464.50 $24.40 $8,052.00 $25.65 $769.50 $24.40 $732.00 2 weeks Antioch Net 30
Visalia, CA

Ready Print $25.70 $8,481.00 $22.94 $7,570.20 $25.70 $771.00 $22.94 $688.20 10 working days SHPT Net 30
Pittsburg, CA

Office Depot $26.64 $8,791.20 No Bid No Bid $36.15 $1,084.50 No Bid No Bid 15-17 working days Antioch Net 30
Fremont, CA

RR Donnelley $27.00 $8,910.00 $26.05 $8,596.50 $30.72 $921.60 $34.83 $1,044.90 10-14 working days Antioch Net 30
San Ramon, CA
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Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
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Vendor Name  Recycled Extension Virgin Extension Recycled Extension Virgin Extension Delivery F.O.B. Discount

Tension Envelope $27.71 $9,145.95 $26.73 $8,820.90 $27.71 $831.30 $26.73 $801.90 7-10 working days Antioch Net 30
Temecula, CA

R. J. McRep $28.00 $9,240.00 $26.58 $8,771.40 $28.00 $840.00 $26.58 $797.40 2 weeks Antioch 1% 10,  Net 30
Vista, CA

Galaxy Press $0.0288 $9,504.00 $0.0259 $8,547.00 $0.0288 $864.00 $0.0259 $777.00 Not specified Not specified Not specified
Concord, CA

Pegasus Interprint $0.030 $9,900.00 $0.025 $8,250.00 $0.036 $1,080.00 $0.029 $870.00 7-10 days SHPT Net 30
Van Nuys, CA

Above prices do not include sales tax.
7/27/10
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