
Earliest Terms/
Vendor Name  Recycled Virgin Recycled Virgin Other Recycled Virgin Other Recycled Virgin Other Delivery F.O.B. Discount

Integrity Bus. Solutions $25.75/M $24.00/M $22.80/M $21.30/M $22.80/M $21.30/M $22.80/M $21.30/M 17-20 days Antioch Net 20
Martinez, CA

CEC Print Solutions $21.68/M $21.68/M $24.97/M $23.95/M $24.97/M $23.95/M $24.97/M $23.95/M Not specified Antioch Net 30
Hayward, CA

Print Club N/A $27.23/M $22.69/M $19.94/M $38.28/M N/A $30.08/M N/A 5-12 days Antioch Net 30
Antioch, CA

Vision Envelope $28.05/M $25.04/M $21.74/M $20.84/M $31.58/M $29.75/M $28.35/M $27.50/M $27.15/M 7-10 days Antioch Net 30
Los Angeles, CA

Office Depot No Bid $34.00/M $38.64/M $37.36/M $38.64/M $37.36/M $38.64/M $37.36/M 17-20 days Antioch Net 30
Fremont, CA

Towne Allpoints Com. $22.08/M $23.05/M $24.34/M $22.46/M $53.18/M $42.53/M $45.86/M $34.77/M 2 weeks T.B.D. 1% cash,
Santa Ana, CA Net 30

Lefavor Envelope $22.00/M No Bid $22.00/M $19.00/M $35.00/ $31.00/ $26.00/ $31.00/ $26.00/ 3 weeks Antioch Net 30
Salt Lake City, UT 10 M 25 M 50 M 30 M 50 M

Tension Envelope $28.05/M No Bid $27.29/M $26.23/M $25.57/M $35.56/M $33.56/M 20 days Antioch Net 30
Temecula, CA

R. J. McRep, Inc. $30.64/M $27.11/M $27.59/M $25.66/M $44.09/M $42.23/M $44.09/M $42.23/M 2 weeks Antioch Net 30
Vista, CA

Central Valley Bus. Forms $26.85/M $25.85/M $22.75/M $21.75/M $35.00/M $33.00/M $32.00/M $31.00/M $30.00/M 2-3 weeks Antioch Net 30
Visalia, CA 10 M 15 M 20 M 30 M 50 M

Above prices do not include sales tax.
4/3/09

Printing of Envelopes

#10 White Envelope w/window
#9 Blue Envelopes

Page 1 of 2

w/"Multiple Billings Enclosed" on front

Same unit price as #10 if ordered

CITY OF ANTIOCH BID TABULATION

#10 White Envelopes w/indicia #10 White, w/window, w/o indicia

Bid No. 310-0317-09 

at the same time.

Closed April 3, 2009, 2:00 p.m.



Earliest Terms/
Vendor Name  Recycled Virgin Recycled Virgin Other Recycled Virgin Other Recycled Virgin Other Delivery F.O.B. Discount

Galaxy Press $36.10/M $35.80/M $36.50/M $33.10/M $108.90/M $101.40/M Not specified Factory Net 30
Concord, CA 10,000 10,000

$78.00/M $70.00/M
20,000 20,000

$67.80/M $58.10/M
30,000 30,000

$61.70/M $52.50/M
40,000 40,000

$57.40/M $48.70/M
50,000 50,000

R. R. Donnelley $40.67/M $34.80/M $38.50/M $32.38/M $72.16/M $43.03/M $43.03/M No Bid 15 days Antioch Net 30
San Ramon, CA 10 M 15 M 30 M

International Security Prod. $21.00/M $20.84/M $25.36/M $25.47/M $38.55/M $38.97/M $28.24/M $29.37/M 2 weeks Antioch Net 30
Paso Robles, CA

Color Kraft Printing $28.53/M $29.10/M $27.87/M $28.36/M $39.85/M $35.20/M $32.88/M $34.53/M $31980/M 10 days Antioch Net 30
Los Angeles, CA

Staples $28.30/M $25.44/M $22.39/M $21.90/M $27.69/M $26.54/M $25.97/M $25.57/M $24.89/M $24.40/M 1 day Fresno Net 30
Newark, CA 10 M 15 M 20 M 30 M 50 M 100 M

4/3/09
Above prices do not include sales tax.

CITY OF ANTIOCH BID TABULATION
Bid No. 310-0317-09 

Closed April 3, 2009, 2:00 p.m.
Printing of Envelopes

Page 2 of 2

w/"Multiple Billings Enclosed" on front#9 Blue Envelopes #10 White Envelopes w/indicia
#10 White Envelope w/Window

#10 White, window


